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ND ref. FOI/17/130 

Freedom of Information 

 
Thank you for your 03/07/17 request for the following information: 
 
Please provide the following information.  If you do not hold the information please advise if it 
is held elsewhere.  If only partial information is held then please provide that. In this request I 
will make reference to neuromuscular conditions, muscular dystrophy, and duchenne 
muscular dystrophy.  
 
For the purposes of this request: 
 

- Neuromuscular conditions refer to any such conditions, including all types of 
Muscular dystrophy; 

- Muscular dystrophy refers to all such conditions including Duchenne muscular 
dystrophy; and 

- Duchenne muscular dystrophy refers only to that specific condition 
  
1.  Please provide information on the total number of unplanned admissions to your Trust 

for patients with the following conditions broken down by hospital (where appropriate) and 
by calendar year since 2011 including data for 2017 to date.  If you hold data by financial 
year then that is acceptable also: 

     a.      Neuromuscular conditions 
b.      Muscular dystrophies 
c.      Duchenne muscular dystrophy 
Answer: Please see table below:    
 

Condition Hospital 2011 2012 2013 2014 2015 2016 2017 

Hereditary 
motor and 
sensory 
neuropathy 

Bideford hospital community services ≤5 
      

Exeter community hospital     ≤5   

Honiton hospital      ≤5  

North Devon District Hospital ≤5  ≤5  ≤5 ≤5 ≤5 

Muscular 
dystrophy 

Bideford hospital community services 
 

≤5 
 

≤5 ≤5 
  

Exmouth hospital     ≤5   

North Devon District Hospital ≤5 ≤5 ≤5 ≤5 7 14 ≤5 

Totals 11 9 7 9 13 19 ≤5 

 
Please note 1: All Muscular Dystrophy types are coded as G71.0 so we are unable to split by types. 
 
Please note 2: In accordance with the Data Protection Act 1998 we are unable to provide 
figures where the number of patients is less than or equal to five and could risk the 
identification of those patients and breach Caldicott principles.  
 
In these cases ≤5 is used to indicate that a figure between 1 and 5 is being suppressed. Also 
note that if only one cell required suppression, at least one other number has been suppressed to 
avoid calculation of suppressed values from the totals. 
 
This follows NHS Digital (formerly HSCIC) analysis guidance (2014) which states that small 
numbers within local authorities, wards, postcode districts, CCG’s providers and Trusts may 
allow identification of patients and should not be published. 
 
2.  Please provide a breakdown of the reasons for the unplanned admissions e.g. Accident, 

breathing problems, etc – this should be broken down by the relevant data sets that you 
hold, broken down by hospital (where appropriate) and by calendar year since 2011 
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including data for 2017 to date.  If you hold data by financial year then that is acceptable 
also. 
Answer: Please see table below, and note 2 from Q1 above:    

 

Referrer Condition 2011 2012 2013 2014 2015 2016 2017 

Consultant 

Hereditary motor and 
sensory neuropathy 

≤5 
 

≤5 
 

≤5 ≤5 
 

Muscular dystrophy 
 

≤5 ≤5 ≤5 ≤5 ≤5 
 

GP 

Hereditary motor and 
sensory neuropathy      

≤5 
 

Muscular dystrophy 
 

≤5 ≤5 ≤5 ≤5 
 

≤5 

Other referrer 

Hereditary motor and 
sensory neuropathy 

≤5  ≤5  ≤5 ≤5 ≤5 

Muscular dystrophy ≤5 ≤5 ≤5 ≤5 7 12  

Self referral Muscular dystrophy      ≤5  

Grand Total 11 9 7 9 13 19 ≤5 

 
Please note - admissions do not have a reason, they are recorded by the diagnosis. 

 
3. Please provide the following outcomes broken down by the same hospitals (as 

appropriate), calendar (or financial) years for each condition as detailed above: 
  

a.      Discharged from A&E 
b.      Admitted to hospital and subsequently discharged 
c.       Died 
Answer: Please see table below, and note 2 from Q1 above:    

 

Outcome Condition 2011 2012 2013 2014 2015 2016 2017 

Discharged on 
medical advice 

Hereditary motor and 
sensory neuropathy 

≤5 ≤5 ≤5  ≤5 ≤5 ≤5 

Muscular dystrophy ≤5 ≤5 ≤5 9 9 14 ≤5 

Died 

Hereditary motor and 
sensory neuropathy 

≤5       

Muscular dystrophy  ≤5 ≤5  ≤5   

Grand Total 11 9 7 9 13 19 ≤5 

 
4.  Please provide a breakdown of unexpected deaths of patients in your Trust broken down 

by the above conditions and by the same hospitals (as appropriate), and by calendar (or 
financial) years. 
Answer: Unexpected death is not recorded on the Trust PAS systems and could only be 
arrived at by clinician review of the medical records. As the total number of deaths is below 
reportable values any unexpected death would also fall below this value. 
 
To collate this information would require our clinical staff manually reviewing individual patient 
records.   
To undertake this piece of work would take in excess of the appropriate limit set by the Freedom 
of Information Act 2000 (section 12 (1)) and defined in the Freedom of Information and Data 
Protection (Appropriate Limit and Fees) Regulations 2004.  The appropriate limit of £450 
represents the estimated cost of one person spending two and a half days in determining 
whether the Trust holds the information, and locating, retrieving and extracting the information.  
Consequently, the Trust is not obliged by the Freedom of Information Act 2000 to retrieve the 
above information.  I regret to inform you that we shall not process your request to the above 
question further. 

 
5.  Please provide details of any changes that your Trust has made to care and other policies 

as a result of unexpected deaths of patients with the referenced conditions in the time 
period stated. 
 Answer: N/A. 
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6.  Please provide a copy of the protocols to be followed by all paramedic, ambulance and 
A&E staff dealing with an unplanned admission of a patient with one of the specified 
conditions.   
 Answer: None. We do not have any Emergency Department specific protocols for the 
management of muscular dystrophy. 

 
7.  Please provide details of adaptations provided by hospitals in your trust for persons with 

neuromuscular (and other) conditions who may not be ambulant, or who may be unable to 
lift items such as cutlery, press buttons etc.  For example, provision of hoists, wash/dry 
toilets, adapted call buttons; intercom systems; modified cutlery; provision of staff to feed a 
patient who is unable to do so him or herself due to muscle wasting. 
 Answer: Please see list below: 
 

 Variety of hoists and stand aids including ceiling track hoist, gantry hoists, mobile 

liko hoists, encore stand aid, Returns, BALO standing frame 

 Specialist seating, wheelchairs and shower chairs including tilt in space 

armchairs/wheelchairs/showerchair, electric wheelchair 

 DDA compliant wet rooms and toilet facilities 

 Modified cutlery 

 Ipads and apps to aid communication/communication aids 

 Volunteers and staff to assist with feeding 

 
8.  Please provide details of the procedures hospitals in your trust follow if a physiotherapist is 

required at night for persons who have a neuromuscular condition, especially if 
physiotherapists are not normally on duty in the night. 
Answer: On-call respiratory physiotherapist can be paged out of hours. 

 
 
  
 


